fawa 9 15 /2018

BTG I
faca fawmT
?1%{ 144 /Tl 2018—04—00428 /fa /1 /&R a1 AR, R’AE 22.3.2018

UARA B HHE QT
e, o ved, faeregR
A fawrreas
AR SR ARgad

‘ IR Belaey
BRae

! fva—sxivrg Rifde Wa (seem) M, 2010 0§ BeiaTe Porqa s &

Ted:—facT faumT &7 3TU9 SHe 320 /TF 2013—01-00099 /& /A /AR, f&id 1

T, 2013

vairaTe fufdd ¥ag (saeme) fam, 2010 & AW 11 A urew @ 6
“BHIE WP Vab, IJaee dfed a1 7 ey & gy dar /@
! g 38 ¥ IR FRaw afr & o scia @ squRed w@ar @ o S/
| UMD V9T V4 ARG &1 gam awsn o o9 9@ & ISaure, g6
# A RRUREY 3t e gy s Paie T
g ¥ Yl $l AR 3 & qd S9 uEe 4as @ ol
FqaRefy @ aRvY & we ¥ 3g gRagaa Jaur R sy
2/ BENTE Iend W 18 ¥ wiawE @ % o9 9@ f6 Tsuurd wne B
fay R’ @ saw & @ g awen fAfafea 9 &, fad 0
AEH 99 & dMaR d9ig a9 4 IR @ty &1 fedh §f o &1
ST Ao 81 fHar S| |
3/ 59 WA g folm for o @ 6 e Wmel @ PRR
/SEHTE B AR B 9F 9§ & WE R A 79 fdar @)
/e fadr @ Ry @ b e AE ¥ AR el & s srqeRerfa
® e yenvil ¥ Saa fEt a1 oo giifha a9 8 e Sl srgterdl
o wfa frder gaa &1 &1 v |



5/ o fifde g (@) fFa|, 2010 & FEd 11 1@ BRINTE el
fr 18§ W @ GRREET W £ 98 WORM IE0 BRATg oS
(sreme=en) ¥ e Yy ¥ yadie g

SEARASENLRF L




U, 145 /7 2018—04—00428 /& /1 /AR T AR, feHTE 22.3.2018

o PN~

o NOe

1.
12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.

19.

ICGINRN

¥, Bwige Wi Qdl AN /9HateR T /g faaies
JTRRT /&N AT, YR

o afera /e wers, 53 (W), BRETe, T YR

g |fEd @ Su Al F3ed, T IR

IS GEAT YT, TE A, IR

T RSN vF wRa i, fae R, R

- e, BN, AT U4 UE, BaiTe, a1 UhUR

TR ARSI, HATed, T4T IAR
WWF{@HWWW@WW
TR HIETAT AT, v/ garad) sivrey, BaRiTe
AR Yrad, o ufknerr e, QR / REER, swihie
e, OHDd orEgd |l vd g8 or, AR

— o ot /snaws FRAE! B

Hoe®, faoia yey U@ guel UOmell, T AR H faw fumm @
JguIse www.cgfinance.nic.in &R 3Udls v Bg Eg

0% 3



BolaTe I
faea fawmT

e AT
Ta1 AR, f&A1F 22 A€, 2018
F. THA 2018—04—00428 /faca /Fram /aR = wRg @ Wy & T 300 B

WIF EN Uew vieadl H W ¥ AR gy, BwiTe @ Iouule], YAgEr,
geiaTe e Qe (Ergem) Fam, 2010 § f=fafea SR deiem a7 €

Frfq—
qmyd
S Fraat 8-
e 11 ¥, oiel od @ = uig 9 AT B B WA R, Ue A ad”
yferenfia s o™ | |
BTG D T ® AW 9
I SATQYTRIR

(T, =Had)
qgT



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance Department
Mantralaya, Mahanadi Bhawan, Naya Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Naya Raipur, Dated 22 March, 2018

No. F 2018-04-00428/Finance/Rules/IV:: In exercise of the powers
conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor of Chhattisgarh, hereby, makes the following further
amendment in the Chhattisgarh Civil Services (Leave) Rules, 2010
namely :-

AMENDMENT

In the said rules,-

In rule 11, for the words "five years", wherever they occur, the
words "three years" shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the
Govemor of Chhattisgarh

(S.K. Chakrabo
Joint Secretafay



piile T
IS il

T TR, {22 A, 2018

%. TH 2018—04—00428 / fa /A /AR = AR @ Wiy @ oY 309 B
ngmwﬁﬁtﬁaﬁmﬂﬂwﬁgq,ma%ww,m,
Wﬁmﬁﬁﬂﬁmﬁaﬁ?mﬂmaﬂﬁﬁ,aaﬁ:— |

Fmed
| gaq e ¥,
‘ mzﬁ,wsﬁ,ﬁm18ﬁ,m'ﬂﬁﬁ"$wﬂu§,m€a‘?ﬂ={aﬁ“
% yferenfia fear o |
w&hwwa%ﬂmr&rﬁﬂmﬁ
TqoIT SRR
(W.a%.aas‘clﬁ)

|y




Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance Department
Mantralaya, Mahanadi Bhawan, Naya Raipur

; NOTIFICATION
Naya Raipur, Dated 22 March, 2018

No. F 2018-04-00428/Finance/Rules/IV:: In exercise of the powers
conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor of Chhattisgarh, hereby, makes the following further
amendment in the Chhattisgarh Fundamental Rules, namely :-

AMENDMENT

In the said rules,-

In Part II, in Chapter III, in rule 18, for the words "five years", the
words "three years" shall be substituted. |

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Chhattisgarh

(S.K. Chakraborty)
Joint Secyetaray





